
NEWS IN WP2 (MAPPING OF MISSION ORIENTED POLICIES, 
INITIATIVES AND ACTORS) 

 

The WP2 mapping team is happy to announce, that the Mission Data Platform went online! It was 
launched on November the 9th in the Mutual Learning Event (MLE) on National Mirror Board 
Structures for EU missions.  

The Mission Data Platform is a repository and data base bringing together multicomponent 
knowledge about mission implementation in different EU-member states and associated countries. It 
showcases gathered data on the development of mission governance structures, actor constellations 
and instrument portfolios across EU Member States and Associated Countries. 

 

The launch of Mission data platform stands at the end of an intense three-step process realised in 
WP2 of the TRAMI project: First, a framework for a mapping was developed that reflects the 
relevant components of mission implementation. Second, partners of EU Member States and 
Associated Countries were approached to fill in the mapping template and thus provided first hand 
information about their respective mission-oriented structures and activities. The third and current 
step was the development of an online tool that serves as a comprehensive and easily accessible 
information database.  

The platform is a dynamic repository that is constantly being expanded and enriched and is kept up 
to date with regular updates. 

Usage and structure of the Mission Data Platform 

In a first step the Mission Data Platform informs about the methodology and data collected by 
explaining the mapping framework. 



In a second step the data about mission-oriented implementations across EU-Member States and 
associated countries can be approached. In detail, the Data Mission Platform informs visitors about 
the Governance structures, including e.g. central strategic coordination, organizers or legal basis; 
Governance activities, in its design – and implementation phase including monitoring & evaluation; 
m economic, financial, regulatory or soft Instruments, and public, private and national actors. These 
data can be retrieved  

(a) Mission specific  

 

 

or (b) Country specific. 

 

 

After choosing one option users see visualisations that are specifically designed for standardized and 
comparable presentation. For details users tick on respective cells and are provided with further 
information.  

With its clear but cross-linked structure, the Mission Data Platform is a valuable tool that facilitates 
the targeted exchange of information. For example, in the Mutual Learning Event, data of the 
Mission Data Platform on mission governance approaches has provided input for a focussed 
comparison across countries. Thus, it fosters cooperation among stakeholders and supports the 
successful implementation of EU missions and mission-oriented policies.  


